
Problem solving is a common
approach of concepts
understanding in mathematics
and science subjects. It bridges
the concept to the real world by
establishing its factual and
realistic application. Students of
mathematics and physical
sciences were able to quickly
grasp the idea because the setting
is based on a real-life setup.
Hence, there is a persisting
problem among mathematics and
physical science students
regarding problem-solving such as
the comprehension and
abstraction of the situation into a
mathematical representation. A
student could not easily construct
a situational picture of the
problem due to the absence of
experience in a particular setup.
With these lapses, students'
understanding of the problem
situation is uncompromised,
leading to misjudgment and an
inability to relate to the concept. 
 According to Wheatley and Cobb
(1990), problem-solving in
mathematics is often a process of
building from images to analysis
and vice versa. Research
conducted by Saundry and Nicol
(2006) shows that the students
use the picture as manipulatives,
system support, and sophisticated
representation and imagery.
Hence, this action research is
trying to determine the reaction
and performance of the students
in college algebra when
image/picture is integrated into
solving linear equation word
problems.

To determine if image integration
significantly affects problem-
solving, 138 randomly selected test
papers from 690 math students of
the University of the Immaculate
Conception were taken as
samples. The test questionnaire
contained fifty multiple-choice
items, but the study concentrates
on four problem-solving things.
Four were presented with images,
and the others were delivered in
word problem format. After the
exam, the students from the four
sections gave their comments
regarding the test items. The
comments were collated from the
responses of the 138 students from
the four different sections taking
up mathematics in the modern
world.
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The result shows that out of 138
student respondents, 75, or 54%,
were able to answer item number
25, which is presented with a
situational image, against 53, or
38%, who were able to answer the
problem in number 26, which is
given without the situational
picture. 

CONCLUSION

Respondents’ comments
regarding the items were mostly
appreciative regarding the images.
Considering that the items
involved were identified as
moderately difficult items, most of
the respondents says that they
were able to easily analyze the
linear problem due to the
presence of illustration. Most
comments regarding the linear
problems without images were
negative such as difficulty in
comprehending the problems,
inability to visualize the situation,
and incorrect interpretation of the
situations. Respondents mostly
suggested that test items should
have images that would help
students easily visualize and
analyze the problem.

Table 1. Correct Answers per Item

Table 2. Response per Item 
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In item number 29, a word
problem alone, only 17 or 12% of
the respondents were able to
answer the item, whereas in item
number 30, which was presented
with an image, 109 or 78% were
able to answer the problem.


